
 
 

 

Town of Hillsborough  
Addendum #1 for the Lawndale Basin Sewer Rehabilitation and Replacement Project 
Questions and Responses from the Pre-Bid Meeting: 7-11-2023  

1. Clarification on the hydrant meter: A hydrant meter is to be rented for water 
consumption during the project. Contractor to put a deposit on the meter and pay the 
rental fee. No charge for water usage. Water must be obtained through the meter, 
direct connections to hydrants are not permitted. 
 

2. Clarification on CIPP curing process for winched insertion: Hot water curing or steam 
curing may be used for the winched insertion method. 
 

3. Clarification on a dump site, for sewage/solids management: Contractor to coordinate 
with the Town of Hillsborough’s WWTP operators for dump site location.  
 

4. Clarification on private property access under the Alternate Bids: The Town will 
coordinate Right-of-Entry agreements with private property owners. 
 

5. Clarification on the method of installation for lateral connections to the mainline: 
Romac saddle allowed for installation of laterals to the mainline. An in-line wye is not 
required.  
 

6. Is CCTV available?: Yes, the Town will upload the CCTV files to the One-Drive folder  
 

7. Will a recording of the pre-bid be made available?: Yes, the pre-bid meeting recording 
link is available here. 
 

8. Clarification on lined manholes: Contractor to repair any manholes damaged during the 
project. If a lined manhole is damaged, it must be repaired per lining manufacturer’s 
recommendations (contact TPT Coating). The manholes below are among those that 
have lining, also see the attached exhibit.  
 

a. SMH-1219  
b. SMH-1218  
c. SMH-1213  
d. SMH-2794  
e. SMH-1211  
f. SMH-1214  
g. SMH-1216  

https://hillsboroughnc1-my.sharepoint.com/:v:/g/personal/bryant_green_hillsboroughnc_gov/EQ7mkPx58YNGvHa2tKsEH8QBrQ3uMC7jWKbFPBD-mD5ECg


 
 

 

h. SMH-1206  
i. SMH-1205  
j. SMH-1222  
k. SMH-1223  
l. SMH-1225  
m. SMH-1230  
n. SMH-1229 
o. SMH-1228 

9. Clarification on warranty period for private property work under the Alternate Bid: The 
Contractor’s plumber must warranty the work on private property directly with the 
homeowner for one (1) year, this warranty will be referenced in the Right of Entry 
document. 
  

10. Clarification of locations under Alternate B: Call out added to Sheet C1.3 for laterals to 
abandon in place.  
 

11. Additional note added to Alternate Bid Notes: Lateral replacements will require some 
field verification by the contractor. The locations of some laterals will likely be different 
than drawn.    
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